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Acid etching of dentin: too early to recommend
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One of the primary concerns related to eavity prep-
aratiotis has been the appropriate protection of the
pulp. For years, the accepted treatment has consisted
of placing a liner or base on the prepared dentinal
surface. In more recent times, it has been recognized
that fhe use of sueh agents in eonjunction with con-
servative cavity preparations generally is nof needed.
Now, however, it has been suggested that prior to
placing a composite resin restoration, the dentinal sur-
face should be etehed with phosphoric aeid. The pro-
ponents of this procedure argue that dentinal etching
with inorganic acids increases the potential for ad-
hesive boriding of the composite resin restoration.

The impetus for such a procedure comes from the
works of Professor Fusayama of Japan, who reeom-
mends etching both the enamel as well as the dentin.
His efforts have been so convincing that at least one
manufacturer of restorative materials markets a phos-
phoric acid gel to be used with its restorative system.

Biologists who study the pulp have found increasing
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evidence that acid etching of dentin under the appro-
priate conditions does not cause irreversible hyper-
emia of the pulp. In fact, some studies have demon-
strated that placement of restorative materials in di-
rect contact with mechanically exposed pulpal tissues
does not result in puipal necrosis. Instead, these stud-
ies have shown that irreversible hyperemia and
necrosis result if there is a microbial invasion or
contamination. More recently, animal studies have
demonstrated that dentinal etching does not cause
pulpal necrosis when used as part of the composite
resin restorative process. All of these experiments
were carried out, however, under rigid experimental
conditions that excluded salivary and microbial
contamination.

While all of this information is most encouraging
for those who advocate dentina! etching, it must he
pointed out that no long-term clinical studies (human
trials) related to this process have been published.
Making recommendations that are dramatically op-
posed to aecepted clinical convention is generally un-
wise until the effects of sueh a proeedure are thor-
oughly investigated. What happens, for example, if all
the tuhules are not sealed during the restorative pro-
cess? What are the prohlem s associated with margins
that are ineompletely closed? And how is all of this
accomplished unless a rubber dam is used routinely?
Under such conditions is there not the possibility or
even probability that microbial invasion can occur?
Until these and other concerns are investigated by
means of clinical investigations using standardized
protocols, it is premature fo recommend procedures
that deviate so dramatically from normal treatment.
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