
Foundations of a Trusting
Doctor-Patient Relationship

As dentists, we have been entrusted, in good
faith, to truly care for all the patients we serve.

This trusting relationship can only work when both
the doctor and patient are doing what is in each
other's best interest. My focus is on our responsi-
bilities as dentists in the hallowed doctor-patient
relationship.

This trust implies that we do only what is in the
patient's best interest. A frequent theme you read
and hear is that a procedure was performed be-
cause it was what the patient wanted. At first this
sounds reasonable. But in my opinion, because of
our training and expertise, we hold a greater re-
sponsibility, one that encompasses but goes beyond
fulfilling the patient's wishes. Take, for instance,
court cases involving malpractice. We know the pa-
tient will not bear the same burden as the dentist.
This is due to the dentist's superior knowledge of
the field and all its ramifications, including indica-
tions, contraindications, and complications to
name a few. The fact still stands that it is the pa-
tient's right to choose and to know what is best for
his/her situation. However, the dentist must focus
on the best interest of the patient and not exclus-
sively on pleasing the patient. For example, if a per-
son has a brain iesion that needs the care of a neu-
rosurgeon, the individual would be wise to consider
that the surgeon has expettise that the individual
does not. The surgeon has the responsibility to ad-
vise and treat the patient, keeping with the highest
standards of the profession. It is widely accepted
that the neurosurgeon has knowledge that the pa-
tient does not, which affects treatment of the brain
lesion, irrespective of what the patient may want.
Again, this does not mean that the patient's power
to choose is taken away. In fact, that is what sec-
ond opinions are all about. But it docs make the ar-
gument of "it is what the patient wanted" simply an
excuse and a blame shift, for where the ultimate re-
sponsibility lies is with the professional.

My interest here still hes mainly with our re-
sponsibilities as dentists. Are we upholding our end
of the connection with our patients by striving for
excellence in all that we do? No one is perfect, but
I have seen so much mediocre and poor dentistry,
it is troubling. Do we treat our patients with dignity
and respect with all of our actions? Or do we sim-
ply use patients for our own financial and power
gains? Do you make patients consistently wait be-
cause you are running late due to poor manage-
ment of your own time? Or perhaps you do not
care if they wait? Do you get to know your pa-
tients, remember their names? I am not talking
about friendly chit chat and weather talk. I am
talking about truly slowing down and revealing
yourself and listening in order to better know your
patients. The rewards are awesome. There are no
insurance codes that can be put on deep relation-
ship building with people. Your patients know if
you truly care for them. Since we have all been pa-
tients otirselves, we know how it feels when we are
just another number, case, production unit, ap-
pointment, or anything else besides a human being
who deserves to be treated with the utmost care,
respect, and dignity. Patients are not just joking
when they say they feel ¡ike they just represent an-
other vacation or a new car. They are looking for
personal involvement from us. Don't we all feel
used when we are treated in an uncaring way?

Some common excuses I hear for not fulfilling
our moral and ethical responsibility to our patients
are: the insurance industry is to blame; you can't
get paid enough to care deeply; I do not have the
time; patients do not want this level of care; it
won't work in my town; you are thinking too ide-
alistically; people do not value quality and excel-
lence; patients won't pay for this level of care; and
a whole litany of other excuses. All the excuses I
hear are just that, excuses.
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But does this void all patient responsibility? Of
course not, for there arc many things patients need
to do in order to fulfill their obligations in this rela-
tionship. We can expect them to keep appoint-
ments, follow agreed-upon treatment plans, tell the
truth, show courtesy to staff and doctor, care for
their own health, and pay for their care. If these
and many other obligations are not kept, the doc-
tor-patient relationships are doomed to fail. In
some cases it may be necessary to end relationships
with patients because they choose not to fulfill their
end of the relationship. I believe it is detrimental to
both the doctor and patient to continue a relation-
ship that is a one-way street. If either party does
not have a relationship based on trust, there exists
a manipulative, unhealthy relationship. This will
not allow the patient or doctor to be all that they
should be.

I believe, based on the trust bestowed upon us by
society, it is our duty to care deeply. For me it is
much more than a duty. It is humbling and reward-
ing to be able to truly care for the people I serve.
What about you?
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